
 
 

 

INTERNATIONAL PORTS GATHER IN LOS ANGELES 
TO DISCUSS COLLABORATION, INFORMATION SHARING, 

NEW TECHNOLOGY  
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
SAN PEDRO, Calif. – Nov. 8, 2017 – A group of leading ports from around the globe 
wrapped up a two-day meeting in Los Angeles this week as part of a maritime 
collaboration called chainPORT, a global initiative established in 2015 to digitally 
connect ports worldwide and boost efficiency within the global maritime supply chain. 
  
The chainPORT initiative is led by the Ports of Los Angeles and Hamburg Port Authority 
in Germany, in collaboration with the Global Institute of Logistics. Other ports 
participating in the third annual meeting are Shanghai, Antwerp, Barcelona, Montreal, 
Felixstowe, Indonesia and Shenzhen. 
  
“Working together to explore best practices and innovation, as well as leading-edge 
technology to improve port operations is more important than ever in a global 
environment,” said Port of Los Angeles Executive Director Gene Seroka. “As a port, we 
need to continue to evolve and adapt to remain both competitive and relevant.” 
  
“Port operations are becoming more and more complex, and we strongly believe port 
authorities working together around the globe can add significant extra value to the 
global supply chain,” said Jens Meier, CEO of the Hamburg Port Authority. 
“Collaboration in a global network of ports and digitization is the way of the future.” 
 
“Historically ports were measured on their ability to accommodate ships and other 
modes of transport effectively and efficiently,” said Kieran Ring, CEO of the Global 
Institute of Logistics, which was instrumental in getting the chainPORT alliance off the 
ground. “However, increased international trade and the global economic environment 

http://www.globeinst.org/chainport/


have given rise to a new breed of customers who demand optimum flexibility, efficiency 
and transparency in their dealings with ports.”  
  
Seroka kicked off the two-day meeting with a presentation about Port of Los Angeles’ 
supply chain optimization pilot project in partnership with GE Transportation.  Together 
they are developing a digital portal that provides real-time shipping information for cargo 
owners and supply chain providers to more effectively track and plan for movement of 
their cargo from ocean transit to final destination.  
 
Meier focused his presentation on a vision of the digitalized port of the future and what 
needs to be done to get there. Presentations were then given by leads of each of 
chainPORT’s five working groups: Smart IT solutions; Implications & Solutions for Ultra 
Large Container Vessels; Digital Change within Port Authorities; Project chainLOG; and 
the Port Academy. 
  
Afternoon keynotes were given by Professor Nick Vyas of University of Southern 
California, who spoke on supply chain optimization and digitization, and Jay Samit, 
Independent Vice Chairman of Deloitte Digital, who discussed the challenges ports 
face, driving their needs for creative solutions. Visiting port representatives also toured 
the Port of Los Angeles, and paid a visit to Virgin Hyperloop One, the commercialized 
land-transportation concept for goods and passenger movement currently being 
developed in Los Angeles.   
  
The Port of Los Angeles is America’s premier port and has a strong commitment to 
developing innovatively strategic and sustainable operations that benefit Southern 
California’s economy and quality of life. North America’s leading seaport by container 
volume and cargo value, the Port of Los Angeles facilitated $272 billion in trade during 
2016.  San Pedro Bay port complex operations and commerce facilitate one in nine jobs 
in the five-county Southern California region. 
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