BID RECAP SHEET

TRANSMITTAL 3

South Bay Ford South Bay Ford
Hawthorne Hawthorne
00.19
2. 1 $ 29,591.84 33,256.70 | $ 30,596.16
3. - 2 $ 29,183.68 31,104.66 | $ 28,616.29 [
4, 2 $ 40,510.21 41,705.00 | $ 38,368.60
5. 2 $ 42 551.02 44,032.02 | $ 40,509.46 -
6 1 $ 45,306.13 [ $ 47660.59 | $ 43,847.74
7. __| 1 $ 57.448.98 58,790.69 | $ 54,087.43
8. 1
no bid no bid no bid
9. 1
I 47,755.11 | no bid no bid
10. 2 $ 30,204.09 | $ 3522711 | $ 32,408.94
11. 1
n no bid no bid no bid
12. 2
$ 32,857.15 | no bid no bid -
THER PG| $ - $ - $ - 3 - $
e
o OTAL $ 802,387.89 | $ 830,248.22 | $ 763,828.29 - $
CDISCOUNT-TOTAL] $ 786,340.13 | $ 813,643.26 | $ 748,551.72 = $
e o DELIVERY: 90-180 120 - 200 days 120 - 200 days
IBILLING:DISCOUNT 2.00% 2.00% 2.00%
25 21 21
1= n y Y
$748,551.80 $763,828.29
R 8% total items 8% per item
CTAWARDED TO: ] VENDOR # oo s VENDOR # o VENDOR # st REASONS i

DATE: 9/6/12

PAGE: 1 OF 1

BID NO.: F-805

BUYER: Michelle Davies




